
ULAX Photo / Video / Audio Consent Form 

In consideration for your minor child’s (hereinafter, “Participant”) participation in any events and 
activities hosted by University Lacrosse LLC (hereinafter, ULAX LLC or ULAX), and for being 
granted permission to enter, for any purpose, Restricted Areas with which we are affiliated 
(“Restricted Area” is hereinafter defined as any area where ULAX events and activities are 
held), the Participant and Participant’s parent and/or legal guardian (“Participant’s Guardian”) 
agrees and consents to the following: 


I, the undersigned, consent to the use, by University Lacrosse LLC and any of its parents, 
affiliates, subsidiaries, licensees and assigns (“ULAX”), of Participant’s participation and 
appearance including, but not limited to, my and/or Participant’s image, voice, performances, 
stories, actions or statements, in video recording(s), audio recording(s), audiovisual 
recording(s), motion picture film(s), soundtrack(s), photograph(s), printed matter or any other 
medium now known or hereafter devised (collectively “Recordings”). ULAX also has my explicit 
permission to use Participant’s and/or my name, likeness, voice and biographical material in 
connection with the Recordings.


I hereby grant ULAX title and all rights, including any copyright and trademark rights, to the 
Recordings made of Participant and/or me by ULAX beginning on the start date of the ULAX 
event for which Participant has joined. As such, I agree that all such Recordings and any 
reproductions thereof, and all plates, negatives, recording tape, and digital files shall be and 
remain the sole and exclusive property of ULAX.


In addition, I hereby understand and agree that ULAX may edit, re-record, create derivative 
works of, duplicate, reproduce, copyright, sell, broadcast, publicly display, publicly perform, 
and/or distribute the Recordings whether in whole or in part, for any purpose as determined in 
ULAX’s sole discretion.


In addition, I waive all claims for compensation or damages based on the use of Participant’s 
and/or my image or voice, or both, by ULAX, including, but not limited to, actions in the form of 
copyright, trademark, tort, or warranty and I waive any right to inspect or approve the finished 
Recordings that may be used in conjunction therewith or to the eventual use that it might be 
applied.


I understand that this consent is perpetual, that I may not revoke it, and that it is binding on my 
heirs and assigns. ULAX shall have the irrevocable right, at its sole discretion, to assign this 
agreement or any rights, duties and obligations hereunder to any party or entity.


I further represent that Participant’s participation with ULAX, including the use of Participant’s 
and/or my image and/or voice in any resulting materials, will not infringe upon the rights of any 
third party.


By electronically signing this waiver, I hereby certify that I am over eighteen (18) years of age 
and am competent to contract in my own name and the name of Participant insofar as the 
above is concerned. If I am under eighteen (18) years of age, my parent(s) and/or guardian(s) 
have read this document and have given their consent by electronically signing this waiver.


This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Colorado, without respect to its 
conflict of laws principles. Any claim or dispute between Participant or Minor’s Guardian and 
ULAX that arises in whole or in part from the Site shall be decided exclusively by a court of 
competent jurisdiction located in Denver County, Colorado.




I have read the foregoing release, authorization and agreement, before affixing my 
signature below and warrant that I fully understand the contents thereof. 

FOR USE IF NOT SUBMITTED ELECTRONICALLY:


_________________________________________ Participant’s Guardian’s Signature

_________________________________________ Print or Type Name

_____________________ Date



